VILLAGE OF ALLOUEZ

Allouez Village Hall - 1900 Libal Street = Green Bay, Wisconsin 54301-2453
Phone No.: (920)448-2800 - Fax No.: (920)448-2850

Department of Public Works

2019 Reservoir Inspection Proposal Summary

Early in March the Village of Allouez and City of De Pere jointly requested proposals from contractors to
perform the inspection of water storage reservoirs in each community. The Wisconsin Administrative Code
requires the inspection of water storage facilities every 5-years. The Code requires a dry inspection of the
interior every 10-years. The following Village Reservoirs are being proposed for inspection under this proposal.

o 141 VanDeHei Road Reservoirs are 300,000 and 800,000-gallon underground storage reservoirs. The interior
of the reservoirs for this inspection will require at a minimum a wet inspection.

o 3211 Libal Street Reservoir is a 250,000-gallon underground storage reservoir. The interior of the reservoir for
this inspection will require at a minimum a wet inspection.

o 821 Dauphin Street Reservoir is a 250,000-gallon underground storage reservoir. The interior of the reservoir
for this inspection will require at a minimum a wet inspection.

o 717 Kalb Street Reservoir is a 250,000-gallon underground storage reservoir. The interior of the reservoir for
this inspection will require at a minimum a wet inspection.

A summary of the proposal cost is attached.



Reservoir Inspection Proposal Summary 3-29-19
Company Name C ity LS
‘Water Tower Clean and Coat, Inc.
Village of Allouez - 141 VanDeHei Road $2,200.00
Village of Allouez - 3211 Libal Street §1,800.00
Village of Allouez - 821 Dauphin Street $1,800.00
Village of Allouez - 717 Kalb Street $1,800.00
City of De Pere - 9th Street $1,800.00
Dixon Engineering, Inc.
Village of Allouez - 141 VanDeHei Road $2,750.00
Village of Allouez - 3211 Libal Street $2,750.00
Village of Allouez - 821 Dauphin Street $2,750.00
Village of Allouez - 717 Kalb Street §2,750.00
City of De Pere - 9th Street $3,400.00
Jim Orr Coating Inspection, LLC
Village of Allouez - 141 VanDeHei Road $5,600.00
Village of Allouez - 3211 Libal Street $2,780.00
Village of Allouez - 821 Dauphin Street $2,780.00
Village of Allouez - 717 Kalb Street $2,780.00
City of De Pere - 9th Street $3,880.00
KLM Engineering
Village of Allouez - 141 VanDeHei Road §2,266.00
Village of Allouez - 3211 Libal Street $1,800.00
Village of Allouez - 821 Dauphin Street $1,800.00
Village of Allouez - 717 Kalb Street $1,800.00
City of De Pere - 9th Street $4,200.00
Midco Diving & Marine
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
Utility Service Associates
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
Suez Advanced Sol
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
Badger State Inspection, LLC
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
Pittsburg Tank & Tower Group
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
LiquiVision Technology, Inc.
Village of Allouez No Bid
City of De Pere No Bid
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